
City of Cody City Council 
AGENDA  

 
Tuesday, April 19, 2022 – 7:00 p.m. (Pre-Meeting to begin at 6:45 p.m.) 

Meeting Place:  City of Cody Council Chambers – 1338 Rumsey Avenue, Cody, WY 
 

Meeting Called to Order 
Pledge of Allegiance 
Moment of Silence 
Roll Call 
Mayor’s Recognitions and Announcements 
 

1. Consent Calendar 
All items under the consent calendar will be acted upon in one motion unless a 
Councilmember or member of the public requests that an individual item be taken 
up under Conduct of Business.  
 

a. Approval of Minutes: Regular Minutes from April 5, 2022,  
b. Approve Vouchers and payroll in the amount of $1,364,865.10. 
 

 
2. Public Comments:  The City Council welcomes input from the public.  In order for 

everyone to be heard, please limit your comments to five (5) minutes per person.  The 
Guidelines for the Conduct of City Council Meetings do not allow action to be taken 
on public comments. 

 
3. Public Hearing 

 
4. Conduct of Business  

 
 

a. Consider authorizing Council Member Diane Ballard to sign the application 
for a Wyoming Cultural Trust Fund application for public murals.  

   Spokesperson: Diane Ballard, Cody Public Arts Committee 
 

b. Resolution 2022-03 
A Resolution Adopting the 2021 International Residential Code, as Modified. 
 Staff Reference:  Todd Stowell, City Planner 
 

c. Resolution 2022-02 
A Resolution Adopting the 2021 Edition of the International Plumbing Code 
 Staff Reference:  Todd Stowell, City Planner 
 

d. Consider awarding bid 2022-01 to Normont Equipment for CCTV Equipment, 
Van upfitting and associated support services in the amount of $186,096.00. 
 Staff Reference:  Phillip Bowman, Public Works Director 



e. Consider rejecting all bid received for Bid 21022-02 and allowing staff to 
rebid the purchase. 
 Staff Reference:  Phillip Bowman, Public Works Director 
  

f. Authorize the Mayor to sign and execute the Amended Cooperative 
Agreement between the Wyoming Department of Transportation, City of 
Cody and Park County for continued participation in the Urban Systems 
Program 

   Staff Reference:  Phillip Bowman, Public Works Director  
 

g. Approve the final plat for the Pederson Minor Subdivision, a 2-lot subdivision, 
subject to conditions of approval. 

   Staff Reference:  Todd Stowell, City Planner 
 
 
 

 
5. Tabled Items 

     
 

 
6. Matters from Staff Members 
 
7. Matters from Council Members 
 
8. Adjournment 

Upcoming Meetings: 
 
April 26, 2022 – Tuesday – Work Session – 5:30 p.m. 
May 3, 2022 – Tuesday – Regular Council Meeting 7:00 p.m. 
 
 
 
 



City of Cody 
Council Proceedings 

Tuesday, April 5, 2022 
 
A regular meeting of the Cody City Council was held in the Council Chambers at City Hall in Cody, 
Wyoming on Tuesday, April 5, 2022 at 7:00 p.m. 
 
Present: Mayor Matt Hall, Council Members Andrew Quick, Jerry Fritz, Emily Swett, Heidi 
Rasmussen, Diane Ballard and City Attorney Scott Kolpitcke, and Administrative Services Officer, 
Cindy Baker 
 
Absent: Council Member Justin Baily and City Administrator Barry Cook  
 
Mayor Matt Hall called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m. 
 
Proclamation – National Services Recognition Day – April 5, 2022 
 
Council Member  Ballard made a motion seconded by Council Member Rasmussen to approve the 
agenda as presented including the Consent Calendar including  Minutes: Regular Minutes from March 
15, 2022, Work Session dated March 22, 2022; approve Vouchers and payroll in the amount of 
$842,361.39; submit Official ballot appointing Penny Robbins, Clerk/Treasurer, Town of Mountain 
View and Michele Richlin, Clerk/Treasurer, Town of Deaver for the two Town seats and Cindy Baker, 
Administrative Service Officer, City of Cody for the City Seat to the WAM JPIC Board of Directors 
all for a three-year term; authorize the Mayor to enter into and sign an Encroachment Easement 
between the City of Cody and 1227 Cody, LLC; approve the proposed updates to the Financial 
Management Policy; and approve the extension of Quote 2021-06 Fuel, extending the current fuel 
contract with Bailey Enterprises Inc. for a period of one year beginning July 1, 2022.  Allowing an 
additional freight fuel surcharge of $0.04 per gallon to be added at that time. Vote was unanimous. 
 
Council Member Swett made a motion seconded by Council Member Fritz to approve a request from 
Park County Travel Council (PCTC) and the Harley Owners Group (HOG) for the Kick-n-it Cody 
2022 Event to be held during June 23-25, 2022.  The organizers request street closures as listed as 
items 1-4 on the Agenda Item Summary Report, which also include Open Container Permits, Malt 
Beverage Permit, Vendor Permit and the use of City Park.  Vote was unanimous. 
 
Council Member Swett made a motion seconded by Council Member Ballard a request from PCTC 
and HOG for the City of Cody to sponsor $2,500 for fees associated with the event including PW 
Staff, Police Staff and Park Reservations, band shell and sound fees. Organizers would still be 
responsible for Vendor Permit fee, Open container and malt beverage Permit fees). Voting in favor 
were Council Members Swett, Quick, Ballard, Fritz and Mayor Hall.  Voting opposed was Council 
Member Rasmussen.  Motion carried.  

 
Resolution 2022-07 
A Resolution Encumbering Funds from the American Rescue Plan Act to Provide Funding for Carpet 
Replacement and Customer Service Station Remodeling at City Hall. Council Member Rasmussen 
made a motion seconded by Council Member Fritz to approve Resolution 2022-07. Vote was 
unanimous 

 
Resolution 2022-08 
A Resolution Encumbering Funds from the American Rescue Plan Act to Provide Funding for the 
Purchase of Tablets and Stands for the Council Dais. Council Member Quick made a motion seconded 
by Council Member Rasmussen to approve Resolution 2022-08. Vote was unanimous 

 
Resolution 2022-09 
A Resolution Encumbering Funds from the American Rescue Plan Act to Provide Funding for to 
Provide Funding for Chip Sealing.  Council Member Fritz made a motion seconded by Council 
Member Ballard to approve Resolution 2022-09. Vote was unanimous 
 
Resolution 2022-10 
A Resolution Encumbering Funds from the American Rescue Plan Act to Provide Funding for Hiring 
a Part-Time Community Services Officer in the Police Department.  Council Member Rasmussen 
made a motion seconded by Council Member Swett to approve Resolution 2022-10.  Vote was 
unanimous 
 
Resolution 2022-11 
A Resolution Electing to use the Standard Allowance for Revenue Replacement Calculations Under 
the American Rescue Plan Final Rule. Council Member Swett made a motion seconded by Council 
Member Rasmussen to approve Resolution 2022-11.  Vote was unanimous 



 
Council Member Fritz made a motion and seconded by Council Member Quick to approve the 
Preliminary plat of Dansie Minor Subdivision, a 3-lot subdivision, with associated variances and 
conditions of approval. Vote was unanimous 

 
Council Member Rasmussen made a motion seconded by Council Member Fritz to approve the 
preliminary plat of the West Avenue Duplexes Subdivision, an 8-lot subdivision, with associated 
variances and conditions of approval.  Vote was unanimous 

 
Council Member Rasmussen made a motion seconded by Council Member Quick to approve the final 
plat for the Bromley Minor Subdivision, a 4-lot subdivision, subject to conditions of approval 
amending item 1.d. to condition  5 and no lots will be sold and no building permits issued until 
condition 5 is  completed. Vote was unanimous 

 
Approve Ordinance 2022-03 –3rd Reading and Final Reading 
An Ordinance Amending Title 3, Chapter 3, Section 3-3-9(b) of the City of Cody Code. Taxi License: 
Driver’s. Council Member Fritz made a motion seconded by Council Member Swett to approve 
Ordinance 2022-03 on 3rd and final reading.  Vote was unanimous 
     
At  9:20 p.m. Mayor Hall adjourned the meeting.  
 
___________________________   _____________________________________ 
Mayor, Matt Hall     Cynthia Baker, City of Cody Clerk 
 



CITY OF CODY Payment Approval Report - COUNCIL MEETING VOUCHER LIST Page:     1

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE Report dates: 4/1/2022-4/30/2022 Apr 14, 2022  09:02AM

Secondary Name Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid

ACKER ELECTRIC INC

61786 VV PUMP HOUSE ELECTRIC WORK 03/21/2022 237.00 237.00

61815 WIRE REBUILT PUMP BACK IN 03/28/2022 292.50 292.50

61816 BALER BYPASS 03/28/2022 130.00 130.00

Total ACKER ELECTRIC INC: 659.50 659.50

ALPINE SERVICES LLC

OR FLESHER, TERESA 040422 REFUND UTILITY DEPOSIT 04/04/2022 161.45 161.45

Total ALPINE SERVICES LLC: 161.45 161.45

AMERICAN FAMILY LIFE ASSUR

4522 AFLAC PREMIUM 04/05/2022 2,140.59 2,140.59

Total AMERICAN FAMILY LIFE ASSUR: 2,140.59 2,140.59

AMERICAN WELDING & GAS, INC.

8433391 CARBON DIOXIDE/CYLINDER RENTAL 03/31/2022 37.83 37.83

Total AMERICAN WELDING & GAS, INC.: 37.83 37.83

BAILEY ENTERPRISES INCORPORATED

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 191.36 191.36

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 1,275.45 1,275.45

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 218.67 218.67

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 72.89 72.89

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 3,024.92 3,024.92

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 164.87 164.87

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 218.67 218.67

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 109.33 109.33

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 30.72 30.72

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 490.73 490.73

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 262.42 262.42

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 195.73 195.73

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 22.10 22.10

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 176.30 176.30

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 .00 .00

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 185.32 185.32

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 30.76 30.76

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 282.14 282.14

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 61.52 61.52

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 1,112.80 1,112.80

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 188.32 188.32

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 1,035.04 1,035.04

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 377.09 377.09

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 .00 .00

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 .00 .00

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 17.83 17.83

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 4.46 4.46

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 8.91 8.91

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 13.37 13.37

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 47.26 47.26

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 6,418.96 6,418.96

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 2,107.09 2,107.09

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 103.17 103.17

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 214.23 214.23

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 108.48 108.48



CITY OF CODY Payment Approval Report - COUNCIL MEETING VOUCHER LIST Page:     2

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE Report dates: 4/1/2022-4/30/2022 Apr 14, 2022  09:02AM

Secondary Name Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 47.26 47.26

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 780.81 780.81

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 465.15 465.15

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 47.26 47.26

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 622.75 622.75

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 128.40 128.40

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 624.03 624.03

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 .00 .00

6052960 Fuel 04/07/2022 1,199.88 1,199.88

Total BAILEY ENTERPRISES INCORPORATED: 22,686.45 22,686.45

BLACK HILLS GAS HOLDINGS, LLC

BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04072022 UTILITIES - BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04/07/2022 1,080.45 .00

BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04072022 UTILITIES - BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04/07/2022 1,639.01 .00

BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04072022 UTILITIES - BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04/07/2022 1,334.17 .00

BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04072022 UTILITIES - BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04/07/2022 1,593.03 .00

BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04072022 UTILITIES - BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04/07/2022 5,200.82 .00

BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04072022 UTILITIES - BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04/07/2022 5,200.82 .00

BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04072022 UTILITIES - BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04/07/2022 797.69 .00

BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04072022 UTILITIES - BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04/07/2022 191.93 .00

BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04072022 UTILITIES - BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04/07/2022 1,134.83 .00

BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04072022 UTILITIES - BLACK HILLS ENERGY 04/07/2022 752.90 .00

Total BLACK HILLS GAS HOLDINGS, LLC: 18,925.65 .00

CARQUEST AUTO PARTS

2874-ID-44746 Hydraulic Fittings C08 03/17/2022 15.04 15.04

Total CARQUEST AUTO PARTS: 15.04 15.04

CBE GROUP INC

33122 GARNISHMENT - WG2108102 03/31/2022 181.43 181.43

Total CBE GROUP INC: 181.43 181.43

CITY OF CODY

040522 RESTITUTION FROM CARL NELSON  MC-2202-
018

04/05/2022 659.75 659.75

Total CITY OF CODY: 659.75 659.75

CODY INVESTMENTS PROPERTIES

14.7510.48 REFUND CREDIT BALANCE 04/04/2022 12.88 12.88

Total CODY INVESTMENTS PROPERTIES: 12.88 12.88

COPENHAVER KATH KITCHEN KOLPITCKE LLC

33122 Legal Services 04/04/2022 2,987.98 2,987.98

33122 Legal Services 04/04/2022 304.90 304.90

33122 Legal Services 04/04/2022 670.77 670.77

33122 Legal Services 04/04/2022 670.77 670.77

33122 Legal Services 04/04/2022 731.75 731.75

33122 Legal Services 04/04/2022 731.75 731.75

Total COPENHAVER KATH KITCHEN KOLPITCKE LLC: 6,097.92 6,097.92

CUSTOM DELIVERY SERVICE INC

FED X G 240 SHIPPING 03/07/2022 14.47 14.47



CITY OF CODY Payment Approval Report - COUNCIL MEETING VOUCHER LIST Page:     3

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE Report dates: 4/1/2022-4/30/2022 Apr 14, 2022  09:02AM

Secondary Name Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid

Total CUSTOM DELIVERY SERVICE INC: 14.47 14.47

CUSTOM GARAGE DOOR LLC

5409 GARAGE DOOR OPENER 03/27/2022 1,090.00 1,090.00

Total CUSTOM GARAGE DOOR LLC: 1,090.00 1,090.00

DANA KEPNER COMPANY

2233148-01 METER REGISTERS 03/24/2022 6,000.00 6,000.00

Total DANA KEPNER COMPANY: 6,000.00 6,000.00

EASTMAN, RINDA

033122 PERSONAL TRAINER - REC CENTER 03/31/2022 139.65 139.65

040122 PERSONAL TRAINER - REC CENTER 04/01/2022 316.57 316.57

Total EASTMAN, RINDA: 456.22 456.22

ENERGY LABORATORIES, INC

DEPARTMENT 6250 461124 COLIFORM TESTING 03/23/2022 160.00 160.00

DEPARTMENT 6250 461442 COLIFORM TESTING 03/23/2022 160.00 160.00

Total ENERGY LABORATORIES, INC: 320.00 320.00

FOUTZ, SUZZETTE

20.0290.15 REFUND CREDIT BALANCE 04/04/2022 112.30 112.30

Total FOUTZ, SUZZETTE: 112.30 112.30

FRANDSEN, TRENTON

12.0570.16 REFUND CREDIT BALANCE 04/04/2022 159.96 159.96

Total FRANDSEN, TRENTON: 159.96 159.96

FREDERICK, LAUREL

040622 RESTITUTION FROM DEBRA HODSON MC-1706-
037

04/06/2022 98.41 98.41

Total FREDERICK, LAUREL: 98.41 98.41

FUEGER, DANIELLE

37548686 REC CENTER REFUND 04/12/2022 81.00 81.00

Total FUEGER, DANIELLE: 81.00 81.00

GROATHOUSE CONSTRUCTION

040522 REFUND TERMINATED ACCOUNT 04/05/2022 132.82 132.82

Total GROATHOUSE CONSTRUCTION: 132.82 132.82

HARRIS TRUCKING AND CONSTRUCTION CO

PARK COUNTY READY MIX 115618 CEMENT SAND SLURRY 29TH ST 03/25/2022 159.05 159.05

Total HARRIS TRUCKING AND CONSTRUCTION CO: 159.05 159.05

HARRISON, TIMOTHY BRUCE

BLUE ASPEN ENTERPRISES LLC 220003 REPAIRS TO LOCKER ROOM 04/05/2022 112.50 112.50

BLUE ASPEN ENTERPRISES LLC 220003 REPAIRS TO LOCKER ROOM/RACQUETBALL



CITY OF CODY Payment Approval Report - COUNCIL MEETING VOUCHER LIST Page:     4

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE Report dates: 4/1/2022-4/30/2022 Apr 14, 2022  09:02AM

Secondary Name Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid

COURT 04/05/2022 187.50 187.50

BLUE ASPEN ENTERPRISES LLC 220003 REPAIRS TO CITY HALL HVAC 04/05/2022 300.00 300.00

Total HARRISON, TIMOTHY BRUCE: 600.00 600.00

HUDDLER, LYNN

3.2710.34 REFUND UTILITY DEPOSIT 03/31/2022 362.52 362.52

Total HUDDLER, LYNN: 362.52 362.52

JONES, AMY

4622 PERSONAL TRAINER - REC CENTER 04/06/2022 833.36 833.36

Total JONES, AMY: 833.36 833.36

KEN GARFF CHEYENNE

040522 BID BOND RETURN 2022-02 04/05/2022 2,445.00 2,445.00

Total KEN GARFF CHEYENNE: 2,445.00 2,445.00

KITCHEN, SCOTT

3312022 MILEAGE REIMBURSEMENT 03/31/2022 46.62 46.62

Total KITCHEN, SCOTT: 46.62 46.62

MSPS

MOUNTAIN STATES PIPE & SUPPLY INV22199 3/4" METERS 04/04/2022 14,108.19 14,108.19

MOUNTAIN STATES PIPE & SUPPLY INV22217 72 100W ITRONS 04/05/2022 6,406.72 6,406.72

Total MSPS: 20,514.91 20,514.91

NCPERS GROUP LIFE INS

C/O MEMBER BENEFITS 4522 PREMIUM 04/05/2022 432.00 432.00

Total NCPERS GROUP LIFE INS: 432.00 432.00

NIELSEN, ALICIA

37525342 REC CENTER REFUND 04/11/2022 545.00 545.00

Total NIELSEN, ALICIA: 545.00 545.00

NORCO, INC.

34607331 BOTTLE RENTAL 03/31/2022 40.92 40.92

Total NORCO, INC.: 40.92 40.92

NORTHWEST PIPE

7641819 15" ELBOW 03/10/2022 957.32 957.32

7677944 VALVE & RISER FOR MTN VIEW PROJECT 02/14/2022 2,544.26 2,544.26

7703208 WEST AVE RAW WATER MATERIALS 04/05/2022 45,691.19 45,691.19

Total NORTHWEST PIPE: 49,192.77 49,192.77

ONE-CALL OF WYOMING

62828 ONE-CALL FEES - MARCH 2022 04/08/2022 22.13 22.13

62828 ONE-CALL FEES - MARCH 2022 04/08/2022 22.13 22.13

62828 ONE-CALL FEES - MARCH 2022 04/08/2022 22.13 22.13

62828 ONE-CALL FEES - MARCH 2022 04/08/2022 22.11 22.11



CITY OF CODY Payment Approval Report - COUNCIL MEETING VOUCHER LIST Page:     5

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE Report dates: 4/1/2022-4/30/2022 Apr 14, 2022  09:02AM

Secondary Name Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid

Total ONE-CALL OF WYOMING: 88.50 88.50

PARK COUNTY

7240 LEC CONTRACT - DISPATCH 04/01/2022 223.56 223.56

7240 LEC CONTRACT - DISPATCH 04/01/2022 3,800.53 3,800.53

7240 LEC CONTRACT - DISPATCH 04/01/2022 670.68 670.68

7240 LEC CONTRACT - DISPATCH 04/01/2022 17,661.27 17,661.27

7240 LEC CONTRACT - CAPITOL EQUIPMENT 04/01/2022 4,520.00 4,520.00

7240 LEC CONTRACT - MAINTENANCE 04/01/2022 1,807.46 1,807.46

7240 LEC CONTRACT - CONSOLE 04/01/2022 39.15 39.15

7240 LEC CONTRACT - CONSOLE 04/01/2022 665.61 665.61

7240 LEC CONTRACT - CONSOLE 04/01/2022 117.46 117.46

7240 LEC CONTRACT - CONSOLE 04/01/2022 3,093.14 3,093.14

7240 LEC CONTRACT - UTILITIES 04/01/2022 1,450.59 1,450.59

7240 ADJ FOR INITIAL NETWORK SEGRAGATION  
CHANGES

04/01/2022 204.52- 204.52-

7240 ANTI VIRUS CLIENT CREDIT 04/01/2022 34.79- 34.79-

Total PARK COUNTY: 33,810.14 33,810.14

PARK COUNTY ANIMAL SHELTER

40122 ANIMAL SERVICE CONTRACT -  APRIL 2022 04/01/2021 4,166.67 4,166.67

Total PARK COUNTY ANIMAL SHELTER: 4,166.67 4,166.67

PARK DISTRICT COURT

33122 GARNISHMENT Civil #29877 03/31/2022 196.97 196.97

Total PARK DISTRICT COURT: 196.97 196.97

PONDEROSA BOTTLING CO

17.2365.15 REFUND UTILITY DEPOSIT 03/21/2022 439.94 439.94

Total PONDEROSA BOTTLING CO: 439.94 439.94

PROVIDENT LIFE & ACCIDENT INS

4522 PREMIUMS 04/05/2022 23.40 23.40

Total PROVIDENT LIFE & ACCIDENT INS : 23.40 23.40

SABER PEST CONTROLL LLC

E149 PEST CONTROL - ELECTRIC 04/01/2022 80.00 80.00

P161 PEST CONTROL - PUBLIC WORKS SH 04/01/2022 50.00 50.00

P161 PEST CONTROL - PUBLIC WORKS SH 04/01/2022 25.00 25.00

P161 PEST CONTROL - PUBLIC WORKS SH 04/01/2022 25.00 25.00

Total SABER PEST CONTROLL LLC: 180.00 180.00

SAUNDERS, ALEC

3312022 MILEAGE REIMBURSEMENT 03/31/2022 25.33 25.33

Total SAUNDERS, ALEC: 25.33 25.33

SCISSORHANDS INC.

6673 STUMP REMOVAL 03/31/2022 500.00 500.00

Total SCISSORHANDS INC.: 500.00 500.00



CITY OF CODY Payment Approval Report - COUNCIL MEETING VOUCHER LIST Page:     6

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE Report dates: 4/1/2022-4/30/2022 Apr 14, 2022  09:02AM

Secondary Name Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid

SECRETARY OF STATE

032322 FILING FEE - NOTARY 03/23/2022 60.00 60.00

041122 FILING FEE - NOTARY 04/11/2022 60.00 60.00

Total SECRETARY OF STATE: 120.00 120.00

SHOSHONE MUNICIPAL PIPELINE

040122 SMP WATER PURCHASE - MARCH 2022 04/01/2022 111,072.90 111,072.90

Total SHOSHONE MUNICIPAL PIPELINE: 111,072.90 111,072.90

SMITH, JENNIFER

040422 REFUND CREDIT BALANCE 04/04/2022 35.00 35.00

Total SMITH, JENNIFER: 35.00 35.00

SMITH, STEVI

033122 REFUND UTILITY DEPOSIT 03/31/2022 137.14 137.14

Total SMITH, STEVI: 137.14 137.14

STANTEC CONSULTING SERVICES INC

1906850 Big Horn Ave Study 04/01/2022 7,997.10 7,997.10

1906850 Big Horn Ave Study 04/01/2022 1,999.27 1,999.27

Total STANTEC CONSULTING SERVICES INC: 9,996.37 9,996.37

STRUEMKE, WILLIAM

040822 REFUND UTILITY DEPOSIT 04/08/2022 40.21 40.21

Total STRUEMKE, WILLIAM: 40.21 40.21

SYSTEMS GRAPHICS INC

ADVANCED INFO SYSTEMS 15773 OUTSOURCE BILLS 03/29/2022 15.63 15.63

ADVANCED INFO SYSTEMS 15773 OUTSOURCE BILLS 03/29/2022 96.62 96.62

ADVANCED INFO SYSTEMS 15773 OUTSOURCE BILLS 03/29/2022 88.46 88.46

ADVANCED INFO SYSTEMS 15773 OUTSOURCE BILLS 03/29/2022 87.87 87.87

ADVANCED INFO SYSTEMS 15773 OUTSOURCE BILLS 03/29/2022 109.19 109.19

ADVANCED INFO SYSTEMS 15782 OUTSOURCE BILLS 03/31/2022 8.30 8.30

ADVANCED INFO SYSTEMS 15782 OUTSOURCE BILLS 03/31/2022 51.29 51.29

ADVANCED INFO SYSTEMS 15782 OUTSOURCE BILLS 03/31/2022 46.96 46.96

ADVANCED INFO SYSTEMS 15782 OUTSOURCE BILLS 03/31/2022 46.65 46.65

ADVANCED INFO SYSTEMS 15782 OUTSOURCE BILLS 03/31/2022 57.96 57.96

Total SYSTEMS GRAPHICS INC: 608.93 608.93

THE OFFICE SHOP INC

198473 COPIER CONTRACT - SHOP 03/25/2022 20.30 20.30

198473 COPIER CONTRACT - SHOP 03/25/2022 20.30 20.30

198473 COPIER CONTRACT - SHOP 03/25/2022 17.92 17.92

198473 COPIER CONTRACT - SHOP 03/25/2022 20.30 20.30

198473 COPIER CONTRACT - SHOP 03/25/2022 20.30 20.30

198473 COPIER CONTRACT - SHOP 03/25/2022 20.30 20.30

Total THE OFFICE SHOP INC: 119.42 119.42

UNUM LIFE INSURANCE - LIFE

4522 PREMIUM 04/05/2022 951.56 951.56



CITY OF CODY Payment Approval Report - COUNCIL MEETING VOUCHER LIST Page:     7

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE Report dates: 4/1/2022-4/30/2022 Apr 14, 2022  09:02AM

Secondary Name Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid

Total UNUM LIFE INSURANCE - LIFE: 951.56 951.56

VAN AUKEN, TRUTH

040122 PERSONAL TRAINER 04/01/2022 106.40 106.40

Total VAN AUKEN, TRUTH: 106.40 106.40

WESCO DISTRIBUTION CORP

WESCO/KVA/MODERN WHOLESALE 796694 BUSHING COVERS 03/23/2022 556.50 556.50

Total WESCO DISTRIBUTION CORP: 556.50 556.50

WEST PARK HOSPITAL

DBA CODY REGIONAL HEALTH A05594395 DUI BLOOD DRAW CASE 22-151 03/05/2022 250.00 250.00

DBA CODY REGIONAL HEALTH A05613419 DUI BLOOD DRAW CASE 22-199 03/19/2022 250.00 250.00

Total WEST PARK HOSPITAL: 500.00 500.00

WESTERN UNITED ELECTRIC SUPPLY

6055748 TEST SWITCHES 03/23/2022 1,138.43 1,138.43

6056045 FIBERGLASS CROSSARMS REPLACEMENTS 03/28/2022 2,950.00 2,950.00

6056291 TESTING LABELS 03/30/2022 67.26 67.26

Total WESTERN UNITED ELECTRIC SUPPLY: 4,155.69 4,155.69

WYOMING ASSOCIATION OF MUNICIPALITIES

17047 WAM REGISTRATION 04/08/2022 90.00 90.00

17047 WAM REGISTRATION 04/08/2022 150.00 150.00

17047 WAM REGISTRATION 04/08/2022 240.00 240.00

Total WYOMING ASSOCIATION OF MUNICIPALITIES: 480.00 480.00

WYOMING DEPARTMENT OF WORKFORCE SERVICES

WORKERS COMPENSATION DIV 4522 CONTRIBUTIONS 04/05/2022 13,360.93 13,360.93

WORKERS COMPENSATION DIV 4522 PD VOLUNTEERS 04/05/2022 11.61 11.61

WORKERS COMPENSATION DIV 4522 REC VOLUNTEERS 04/05/2022 5.80 5.80

Total WYOMING DEPARTMENT OF WORKFORCE SERVICES: 13,378.34 13,378.34

WYOMING HEALTH FAIRS

B0032053 BLOOD DRAW 03/14/2022 45.00 45.00

B0032053 BLOOD DRAW 03/14/2022 225.00 225.00

B0032496 BLOOD DRAW 04/02/2022 45.00 45.00

B0032496 BLOOD DRAW 04/02/2022 45.00 45.00

Total WYOMING HEALTH FAIRS: 360.00 360.00

WYOMING MUNICIPAL POWER AGENCY

202203-1 DEMAND PURCHASE - MAR 2022 04/01/2022 346,799.25 346,799.25

202203-1 POWER PURCHASE - MAR 2022 04/01/2022 318,087.54 318,087.54

Total WYOMING MUNICIPAL POWER AGENCY: 664,886.79 664,886.79

WYOMING RETIREMENT SYSTEM

222129 CONTRIBUTIONS - 04/05/2022 28,179.44 28,179.44

222130 CONTRIBUTIONS - 04/05/2022 47,989.31 47,989.31

222131 CONTRIBUTIONS - 04/05/2022 50,444.74 50,444.74



CITY OF CODY Payment Approval Report - COUNCIL MEETING VOUCHER LIST Page:     8

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE Report dates: 4/1/2022-4/30/2022 Apr 14, 2022  09:02AM

Secondary Name Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid

Total WYOMING RETIREMENT SYSTEM: 126,613.49 126,613.49

ZIVARO INC

IC0454432 EVAULT CLOUD DATA STORAGE 03/29/2022 28.24 28.24

IC0454432 EVAULT CLOUD DATA STORAGE 03/29/2022 282.40 282.40

IC0454432 EVAULT CLOUD DATA STORAGE 03/29/2022 9.41 9.41

IC0454432 EVAULT CLOUD DATA STORAGE 03/29/2022 28.24 28.24

IC0454432 EVAULT CLOUD DATA STORAGE 03/29/2022 56.48 56.48

IC0454432 EVAULT CLOUD DATA STORAGE 03/29/2022 37.65 37.65

IC0454432 EVAULT CLOUD DATA STORAGE 03/29/2022 367.12 367.12

IC0454432 EVAULT CLOUD DATA STORAGE 03/29/2022 47.07 47.07

IC0454432 EVAULT CLOUD DATA STORAGE 03/29/2022 28.24 28.24

IC0454432 EVAULT CLOUD DATA STORAGE 03/29/2022 28.24 28.24

IC0454432 EVAULT CLOUD DATA STORAGE 03/29/2022 28.25 28.25

Total ZIVARO INC: 941.34 941.34

Grand Totals: 1,109,706.85 1,090,781.20

Report Criteria:

Detail report.

Invoices with totals above $0 included.

Paid and unpaid invoices included.

Invoice Detail.Input date = 04/12/2022

Invoice.Batch = {NOT LIKE} "1"

Payroll 4/10/22        255,158.25
Total          1,364,865.10





































RESOLUTION 2022-02 
 

A RESOLUTION ADOPTING THE 
2021 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE 

 
 

WITNESSETH: 
 

WHEREAS, 9-2-1 of the Cody City Code states that the City will adopt by 
resolution the provisions of the International Plumbing Code that are in the best interest of 
the City; 

 
WHEREAS, the 2018 edition of the International Plumbing Code has been in effect 

in the City of Cody and the 2021 edition has been published, which 2021 edition has been 
reviewed and found to be reasonable and in the best interest of the City to adopt; 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF 

THE CITY OF CODY that the 2021 Edition of the International Plumbing Code is hereby 
referred to and adopted as though set forth herein, and that the effective date for use within 
the City of Cody shall commence May 1, 2022. 

 
 

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED THE 19th DAY OF APRIL 2022. 
             
           
      
Matt Hall, Mayor 
 
Attest: 
 
      
Cynthia Baker, Administrative Services Officer 



AGENDA ITEM NO. _______ 
City of Cody City Council    Page 1 of 1 

 
 
 
 
 
 

AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY REPORT 
 

Resolution 2022-03:  A Resolution Adopting the  
2021 International Residential Code, as Modified 

ACTION 
Approve a resolution to adopt the 2021 International Residential Code, as modified. 
  
SUMMARY 
Presently, the City of Cody regulates the construction of one- and two-family dwellings, and townhouses 
in accordance with the 2018 International Residential Code, with modifications.  The 2021 edition of the 
International Residential Code is now available. Section 9-2-1(C) of the city code specifies that the City 
will adopt by resolution the provisions of the International Residential Code that are in the best interest of 
the City. 
 
The City Council has full authority to adopt, modify, or delete any provision of the International 
Residential Code (IRC) they desire.  City staff has edited the 2021 version in accordance with edits to 
the 2018 version, current practices, conversations with subject matter experts, and review by the 
City’s Contractors Board. 
 
With the edits proposed, there is actually little difference between the 2021 version and the 1018 
version that the City has been using.  We continue to eliminate the fire sprinkler requirements, 
although fire sprinklers are still available as an alternative, and instead rely on fire-rated drywall to 
provide separation between areas that have historically required fire protection.  The proposal 
continues to simplify, reduce, and delete some of the requirements related to energy efficiency (e.g. 
insulation requirements less than published version, no air infiltration testing, and no solar-ready 
requirements).  A few of the more significant changes that would occur include adoption of 
specialized provisions for straw bale construction, a few changes to the nailing schedule, new footing 
dimensions and span lengths for deck construction, and new tables for metal-framed construction. 
 
The full text of the 2021 edition of the International Residential Code can be found on this website: 
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IRC2021P2 
 
ALTERNATIVES 

1. Approve the resolution. 
2. Deny the resolution (we would continue to operate under the 2018 edition, as modified). 

 
RECOMMENDATION: 
Approve a resolution to adopt the 2021 edition of the International Residential Code, as modified. 
 
ATTACHMENTS: 
Resolution 2022-03 

MEETING DATE:  APRIL 19, 2022 
DEPARTMENT:  COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT 
PREPARED BY:  TODD STOWELL  
CITY ADM. APPROVAL: ________ 
PRESENTED BY:  TODD STOWELL 



RESOLUTION 2022-03 
 

A RESOLUTION ADOPTING THE  
2021 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, AS MODIFIED  

 
WITNESSETH: 

 
WHEREAS, the State of Wyoming has granted the City of Cody local code 

enforcement and plan review authority for Building, Fire, Existing Building, Fuel Gas, 
Mechanical, and Electrical standards; and, 

 
WHEREAS, 9-2-1(D) of the Cody City Code states that the City will adopt by 

resolution the provisions of the International Residential Code that are in the best interest 
of the City; and,  

 
WHEREAS, the City of Cody desires to provide a common set of requirements for 

the construction of residential structures covered by the 2021 International Residential 
Code. 

 
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF CODY that the 

International Residential Code, 2021 Edition, including Appendices AA, AB, AC, AD, AE, 
AG, AH, AJ, AQ, and AS are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof as though 
set forth herein, provided however, the following portions of the International 
Residential  Code are hereinafter modified and amended as described below: 

 
1. Section R101.1 Title, is modified to read: “These provisions shall be known as 

the Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings of the City of Cody, 
Wyoming and shall be cited as such and will be referred to herein as “this code”. 
 

2. The following Exception is added to Section R101.2 Scope: 
The following shall be permitted to be constructed in accordance with this code: 

1. Owner occupied lodging houses with five or fewer guest rooms and 10 
or fewer occupants; 

2.  Boarding houses in one and two-family dwellings and townhomes 
when the dwelling is occupied as a short-term rental; and, 
 

3. Section R102.2 Other Laws, is modified to read: “The provisions of this code 
shall not be deemed to nullify any provisions of local, state or federal law.  In case 
of conflict between this code and any other City ordinances or local laws that 
exercise control over the same feature, the more stringent regulation shall apply.” 
 

4. Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit: 
Exemption #1 is modified as follows: “Other than storm shelters, one-story 
detached accessory structures, provided that the floor area does not exceed 120 
square feet as measured at the perimeter of all walls and roof supports (e.g., posts 
and columns).” 
 
Exemption #2 (Fences) is deleted. 
 
Exemption #3 is modified to read: “Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet in 
height measured from the bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless 
supporting a surcharge or located within a public easement or right of way.  
Retaining walls within public easements and rights of way shall further require 
approval from the Cody City Council.” 
 
Exemption #5 is modified to read: “Sidewalks and driveways on private property 
when not serving as ADA compliant means of travel.” 
 



Exemption #8 is modified to read: “Private swings and other private playground 
equipment.” 
 
Exemption #10 is modified to read: “Decks and patios not exceeding 120 square 
feet in area, that are not more than 30 inches above grade at any point, are not 
attached to a dwelling, and do not serve the exit door required by Section R311.4.  
This exemption does not apply to any covering (e.g., pergola or awning) or roof 
structure over the deck or patio.” 
 

5. Table R301.2 Climactic and Geographic Design Criteria shall be modified to read 
as follows. The “Manual J Design Criteria” portion of the table is not adopted as a 
required design process, but may be used voluntarily using values approved by the 
building official.   

 
  

6. R302.2 Townhouses and R302.3 Two-family Dwellings are modified as follows:  
 
R302.2 Townhouses and two-family dwellings with units separated by a lot 
line. Walls separating either townhouse units or two-family dwelling units that are 
also separated by a lot line shall be constructed in accordance with Section 
R302.2.1.  Walls separating townhouses that will not be separated by a lot line 
shall be constructed in accordance with either Section 302.2.1 or R302.2.2. 
R302.2.1 Double walls. Each townhouse or two-family dwelling unit shall be 
separated from other townhouse or two-family dwelling units by two 1-hour fire-
resistance-rated wall assemblies tested in accordance with ASTM E119, UL 263 
or Section 703.2.2 of the International Building Code. 
R302.2.2 Common walls. Common walls separating townhouse units or two-
family dwelling units shall be assigned a fire-resistance rating in accordance with 
Item 1 or 2 and shall be rated for fire exposure from both sides. Common walls 
shall extend to and be tight against the exterior sheathing of the exterior walls, or 
the inside face of exterior walls without stud cavities, and the underside of the 
roof sheathing. The common wall shared by two townhouse units or two-family 
dwelling units shall be constructed without plumbing or mechanical equipment, 
ducts or vents, other than water-filled fire sprinkler piping in the cavity of the 
common wall. Electrical installations shall be in accordance with Chapters 34 
through 43. Penetrations of the membrane of common walls for electrical outlet 
boxes shall be in accordance with Section R302.4. 
1. Where an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section P2904 is 
provided, the common wall shall be not less than a 1-hour fire-resistance-rated 
wall assembly tested in accordance with ASTM E119, UL 263 or Section 703.3 of 
the International Building Code. 
2. Where an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section P2904 is not 
provided, the common wall shall be not less than a 2-hour fire-resistance-rated 
wall assembly tested in accordance with ASTM E119, UL 263 or Section 703.3 of 
the International Building Code. 
Exception:  Common walls are permitted to extend to and be tight against the 
inside of the exterior walls if the cavity between the end of the common wall and 
the exterior sheathing is filled with a minimum of two 2-inch nominal thickness 
wood studs. 
R302.2.3 Continuity. The fire-resistance-rated wall or assembly separating 
townhouses, and for two-family dwellings with units separated by a lot line, shall 
be continuous from the foundation to the underside of the roof sheathing, deck or 



slab. The fire-resistance rating shall extend the full length of the wall or assembly, 
including wall extensions through and separating attached enclosed accessory 
structures. 
R302.2.4 Parapets for townhouses and two-family dwellings with units 
separated by a lot line. Parapets constructed in accordance with Section R302.2.5 
shall be constructed for townhouses and for two-family dwellings with units 
separated by a lot line as an extension of exterior walls or common walls 
separating townhouse and two-family dwelling units in accordance with the 
following: 
1. Where roof surfaces adjacent to the wall or walls are at the same elevation, the 
parapet shall extend not less than 30 inches (762 mm) above the roof surfaces. 
2. Where roof surfaces adjacent to the wall or walls are at different elevations and 
the higher roof is not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above the lower roof, the 
parapet shall extend not less than 30 inches (762 mm) above the lower roof 
surface. 
Exception: A parapet is not required in the preceding two cases where the roof 
covering complies with a minimum Class C rating as tested in accordance with 
ASTM E108 or UL 790 and the roof decking or sheathing is of noncombustible 
materials or fire-retardant-treated wood for a distance of 4 feet (1219 mm) on each 
side of the wall or walls, or one layer of 5/8-inch (15.9 mm) Type X gypsum 
board is installed directly beneath the roof decking or sheathing, supported by not 
less than nominal 2-inch (51 mm) ledgers attached to the sides of the roof framing 
members, for a distance of not less than 4 feet (1219 mm) on each side of the wall 
or walls and any openings or penetrations in the roof are not within 4 feet (1219 
mm) of the common walls. Fire-retardant-treated wood shall meet the 
requirements of Sections R802.1.5 and R803.2.1.2. 
3. A parapet is not required where roof surfaces adjacent to the wall or walls are at 
different elevations and the higher roof is more than 30 inches (762 mm) above 
the lower roof. The common wall construction from the lower roof to the 
underside of the higher roof deck shall have not less than a 1-hour fire-resistance 
rating. The wall shall be rated for exposure from both sides. 
R302.2.5 Parapet construction. Parapets shall have the same fire-resistance 
rating as that required for the supporting wall or walls. On any side adjacent to a 
roof surface, the parapet shall have noncombustible faces for the uppermost 18 
inches (457 mm), to include counterflashing and coping materials. Where the roof 
slopes toward a parapet at slopes greater than 2 units vertical in 12 units horizontal 
(16.7-percent slope), the parapet shall extend to the same height as any portion of 
the roof within a distance of 3 feet (914 mm), and the height shall be not less than 
30 inches (762 mm). 
R302.2.6 Structural independence. Each townhouse and each two-family 
dwelling unit separated by a lot line, shall be structurally independent. 
Exceptions: 
1. Foundations supporting exterior walls or common walls. 
2. Structural roof and wall sheathing from each unit fastened to the common wall 
framing. 
3. Nonstructural wall and roof coverings. 
4. Flashing at termination of roof covering over common wall. 
5. Townhouses separated by a common wall as provided in Section R302.2.2, Item 
1 or 2. 
6. (Deleted.) 
 
R302.3 Two-family dwellings not divided by a lot line. Dwelling units in two-
family dwellings that will not be separated from each other by a lot line shall be 
separated from each other by wall and floor assemblies having not less than a 1-
hour fire-resistance rating where tested in accordance with ASTM E119, UL 263 
or Section 703.3 of the International Building Code. Such separation shall be 
provided regardless of whether a lot line exists between the two dwelling units or 
not. Fire resistance-rated floor/ceiling and wall assemblies shall extend to and be 
tight against the exterior wall(s), foundation, and underside of the roof sheathing, 
as applicable, to provide a complete 1-hour fire resistance rated barrier between 



the two dwelling units and between any dwelling unit and any common area 
shared by the units. and wall assemblies shall extend from the foundation to the 
underside of the roof sheathing. 
Exceptions: 
1. A fire-resistance rating of 1/2 hour shall be permitted in buildings equipped 
throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with 
Section P2904. 
2. Wall assemblies need not extend through attic spaces where the ceiling is 
protected by not less than 5/8-inch (15.9 mm) Type X gypsum board, an attic draft 
stop constructed as specified in Section R302.12.1 is provided above and along 
the wall assembly separating the dwellings and the structural framing supporting 
the ceiling is protected by not less than 5/8-inch Type X gypsum board or 
equivalent. 
3.Where the dwelling units are not divided by a lot line, the fire-resistance rated 
wall assembly separating the dwelling units may have a door assembly installed to 
allow access between the dwelling units, provided the door meets the 
specifications of International Building Code, Table 716.1(2); Minimum fire door 
assemblies for 1 hour fire barriers having a fire-resistance rating of not less than 
1 hour. The door shall be tight sealing, self-closing and latching, and lockable 
from both sides. Alternatively, two back-to-back doors, each with one-half of the 
fire resistance rating otherwise required by Table 716.1(2), and meeting the other 
provisions of this paragraph may be used in lieu of a single door. 
R302.3.1 Supporting construction. Where floor assemblies are required to be 
fire-resistance rated by Section R302.3, the supporting construction of such 
assemblies shall have an equal or greater fire-resistance rating. 
 

7. Table R302.6 Dwelling-Garage Separation is modified by replacing all 
references to “½-inch gypsum board” with “5/8-inch Type X gypsum board”, and 
the language of the last row of the table is modified as follows: 
Separation:     Material: 
Garages and accessory buildings 
located less than 5 feet from a 
dwelling unit on the same lot. 

Not less than 5/8” Type X gypsum 
board or equivalent applied to the 
interior side of the parallel exterior 
wall of the garage/accessory building 
within this area. 

 
8. Section R302.7 Under-stair protection is modified as follows: “Enclosed space 

under stairs that is accessed by a door or access panel shall have walls, under-stair 
surface and any soffits protected on the enclosed side with 5/8-inch Type X 
gypsum board.” 
 

9. Exceptions 2 and 3 of Section R302.13 Fire protection of floors are modified as 
follows: 
 
Exception 2 is modified to read: “Floor assemblies located directly over a crawl 
space not intended for storage or for the installation of fuel fired or electric-
powered heating equipment or appliances, except as follows: If a fuel fired 
appliance or equipment is installed in a crawl space, the horizontal assembly 
above the appliance shall be covered with 5/8-inch Type X gypsum board, or 
equivalent, above and for a distance of at least two feet horizontally from the 
perimeter of the appliance or equipment, and any joints shall be fire-taped or 
sealed.  Penetrations of the gypsum board by ducting, plumbing pipes, electrical 
conduit or wires shall be permitted and all penetrations shall be tight fitting. 
 
Exception 3 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following:  
3. Floors above unfinished basements, when the following requirement is met: 



If a fuel-fired appliance or equipment is installed in a basement, the entire 
mechanical room or area shall be covered on the inside with 5/8” Type X gypsum 
board or equivalent and all joints and screws shall be fire taped or sealed.  
Penetrations of the membrane by ducting, plumbing pipes, electrical conduit or 
wires shall be permitted and all penetrations shall be tight fitting. The door serving 
the room shall be a rated-fire door complying with the standards used in Section 
R302.5.1.” 
 

10. Section R309.5 “Fire sprinklers” (garage) is deleted in its entirety. 
 

11. Section R310.5 “Replacement Windows for Emergency Escape and Rescue 
Openings” is deleted in its entirety. 
 

12. Section R310.6 “Dwelling Additions” is deleted in its entirety. 
 

13. Section R310.7 “Alterations or Repairs of Existing Basements” is deleted in its 
entirety. 
 

14. Section R313 “Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems” is deleted in its entirety; 
provided, installation of an automatic sprinkler system designed and installed in 
accordance with Section P2904 or NFPA 13D, may be voluntarily provided.  
When such a sprinkler system is provided, ½” gypsum board, rather than 5/8” 
Type X gypsum board, is sufficient to comply with the provisions of this 
resolution for all areas protected by the system.  
 

15. Section R320 “Accessibility” is deleted in its entirety. 
 

16. Section M1411.4 “Condensate Pumps” is deleted in its entirety. 
 

17. Section M1502.4.2 shall be modified to read: “Exhaust ducts shall be supported at 
intervals not to exceed 8 feet and shall be secured in place. The inset end of the 
duct shall extend into the adjoining duct or fitting in the direction of airflow. 
Exhaust duct joints shall be sealed in accordance with Section M1601.4.1. Ducts 
shall not be joined with screws or similar fasteners that protrude more than 1/8 
inch into the inside of the duct. Where dryer exhaust ducts are enclosed in wall or 
ceiling cavities, such cavities shall allow the installation of the duct without 
deformation.  Each vertical riser shall be provided with a means for cleanout 
located near the bottom of the riser.”  
 

18. Section G2404.11 “Condensate pumps” is deleted in its entirety.  
 

19. Section P2502.1 “Existing Plumbing Systems” is deleted in its entirety. 
 

20. Section P2603.5.1 “Sewer Depth” is modified to read “Building sewers shall not 
be less than 48 inches below grade, unless adequate provision is made to protect 
such pipes from freezing by insulation. With insulation, the minimum protected 
depth is 24 inches.” 
 

21. Section P2705.1 “Installation”, Item 3 is modified to read “Where fixtures come 
in contact with walls and floors, the contact shall be water tight.  Water closets 
(toilets) shall be exempt from this requirement in one and two-family dwellings 
and townhouses.” 
 

22. Section P2906.4 “Water Service Pipe”:  The following sentence is added as the 
first sentence of the section.  “Water service piping from the curb stop or meter pit 



to inside of a building meter or shut-off valve location shall comply with City of 
Cody Code 8-2-7, or equivalent approved by the Public Works Director.” 
 

23. Chapter 11, Energy Efficiency, of the IRC is deleted in its entirety and replaced 
with the following:  

Chapter 11, Minimum Energy Efficiency Requirements for Habitable Space. 
Energy Efficiency standards for habitable space shall be as follows: 
 
a. Ceilings with attic spaces: Attic insulation shall be a minimum of R-49.  
Baffles shall be installed in truss or joists bays at intervals consistent with the attic 
ventilation requirements of Section R806.1 through 806.4.   

 
b. Ceilings without attic spaces and unvented enclosed rafter assembles: 
Insulation and construction methods shall comply with Section 806.5.  In addition, 
for roof/ceiling assemblies which do not allow sufficient space for the required 
insulation, the minimum required insulation for such roof/ceiling assemblies shall 
be R-30.  This reduction in R value shall be limited to 500 square feet or 20% of 
total insulated ceiling area, whichever is less. 
 
c. Above Grade Exterior Walls and Rim Joists:  Above-grade exterior 
walls and rim joists shall be insulated with a minimum of R-19 insulation, except 
for log homes designed in accordance with ICC 400-2017 Code.  

 
d. Crawl Space Walls:  No requirement, except for the minimum R-19 
insulation in the rim joist.  If the crawl space wall is insulated, it is recommended 
that it be done using two inches of unfaced extruded polystyrene insulation board 
extending from the top of the footer to the top of the foundation wall.  The 
insulation board may be installed on the interior or exterior side of the wall.  If 
installed on the exterior side of the crawl space wall, it shall be protected by 
flashing. If installed on the interior side, the edges and seams of the insulation 
board shall be sealed to prevent air infiltration between the insulation board and 
foundation wall. 
 
e. Basement Walls: Basement walls enclosing directly heated or cooled 
conditioned space (i.e., finished area) shall be insulated with a minimum of R-10 
foam board or R-13 batt insulation. 
 
f. Glazing: All glazed fenestration in habitable spaces shall have a U-Factor 
of .32 or less as documented on the factory sticker on each window. Glazing shall 
be double glazed in habitable spaces.  

 
g. Air barrier, air sealing, and insulation installations shall be in 
accordance with Table N1102.4.1.1 (R402.4.1.1).  

 

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED THIS 19th DAY OF APRIL, 2022. 
            

 
 
__________________________ 
Matt Hall 
Mayor 

Attest: 
 
 
_______________________________ 
Cynthia Baker 
Administrative Services Officer 



AGENDA ITEM NO. _______ 
City of Cody City Council    Page 1 

 
 
 
 
 

AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY REPORT 
 

Bid 2022-01 for (1) New Long Range CCTV Pipe Inspection System 
 
ACTION TO BE TAKEN  
Consider approval of award of Bid 2022-01 to Normont Equipment for an Envirosight pipe inspection 
system, the upfitting of a City provided van, and the support plan and web service fees for the first 
year of ownership in the amount of $186,096.00. 
 
SUMMARY OF INFORMATION 
The approved FY 2022 Budget includes funding for a new sewer camera system (aka CCTV pipe 
inspection system) for primary use by the Wastewater Division and the support of other public works 
divisions.  This will replace the current CCTV system which is outdated and no longer supported by 
the company.   
 
Bid packets were sent to Cues Inc, Dawson Infrastructure Solutions, Normont Equipment and Vortex 
Products. 
 
One bidder submitted one bid.  This bid was opened at City Hall on March 3, 2022.  
  

Normont Equipment submitted one bid for an Envirosight Rovver X pipe inspection system with 
WinCan software in the amount of $120,220.00.  This bid also included pricing for options as 
follows: 
Annual Support Plan    $8,348.00/Annually 
WinCan Web Service    $828.00/Annually 
Upfitting of Van (Owner provided)   $56,700.00 
Specified Van (Vendor provided)   $59,490.00 (not recommended) 
 

The total cost of the recommended items above plus the CCTV equipment is $186,096.00. 
 
FISCAL IMPACT 
The purchase of this equipment is funded in the approved FY 2022 Budget in the amount of 
$160,592.00 within the Capital Improvements Plan, Capital Machinery, from the Wastewater 
Enterprise Fund.  The additional funding, of $25,504.00, will be addressed in a future budget 
amendment utilizing Wastewater Enterprise Fund Reserves.  
 
ATTACHMENTS 

1. Bid Packet 2022-01 completed by Normont Equipment (submitted bid) 
 
AGENDA & SUMMARY REPORT TO: 
1. Luke Stewart, Normont Equipment, lstewart@nmeqco.com  

MEETING DATE: 4/19/2022 

DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS - WASTEWATER 

PREPARED BY:  ROB KRAMER 
PRESENTED BY: PHILLIP M. BOWMAN, P.E. 































































AGENDA ITEM NO. _______ 
City of Cody City Council    Page 1 

 
 
 
 
 

AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY REPORT 
 

Bid 2022-02 for (1) New 2022 or Newer Transit Cargo Van 
 

ACTION TO BE TAKEN  
Consider rejecting all bids for Bid 2022-02 to allow staff to rebid the unit at a later date. 
 
SUMMARY OF INFORMATION 
The approved FY 2022 Budget includes funding for a new cargo van to be upfitted with a CCTV pipe 
inspection system for use within the Wastewater Division.  This van will replace a 1998 Chevrolet 
cargo van that currently houses the City’s CCTV inspection equipment system, and this van and 
equipment combination will be sold at public auction upon replacement. 
 
Bid packets were sent to Denny Menholt, Fremont Motor Companies, Greiner Ford of Casper, and 
Ken Garff Automotive.  This bid was opened at City Hall on March 29, 2022, and two bidders 
submitted bids:  
  

Greiner Ford of Casper, submitted one bid for a Ford R3X HR Cargo Van in the amount of 
$45,631.00. 
 
KGA-Chey LLC (Ken Garff Automotive), submitted one bid for a Ford R3X HR Cargo Van in 
the amount of $48,900.00. 

 
Based on discussions with both vendors submitting bids, City Staff believes that better pricing can be 
attained by rebidding this purchase around May of 2022 or later.  Both bidders indicated that 
availability of this cargo van is very limited at their partnership dealers around the region and country, 
and that the manufacturers plan to release “build slots” starting in May that will allow for more 
accurate pricing on the bids.  By waiting this additional amount of time, staff believes there could be a 
cost savings on the purchase and no difference in the date of actual delivery of the van.  
 
City Staff recommends rejecting all bids for Bid 2022-02.   
 
FISCAL IMPACT 
The purchase of this equipment is funded in the approved FY 2022 Budget in the amount of 
$40,000.00 within the Vehicle Replacement Fund.   
 
ATTACHMENTS 

1. Bid Packet 2022-02 completed by Greiner Ford of Casper 
2. Bid Packet 2022-02 completed by Ken Garff Cheyenne 

 
AGENDA & SUMMARY REPORT TO: 

1. Eric Suppes, Greiner Ford of Casper, esuppes@lithia.com 
2. Ron Downey, KGA-Chey LLC, rdowney@kengarff.com 

MEETING DATE: 4/19/2022 

DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS - WASTEWATER 

PREPARED BY:  ROB KRAMER 
PRESENTED BY: PHILLIP M. BOWMAN, P.E. 

























AGENDA ITEM NO. _______ 
City of Cody City Council    Page 1 

 
 
 
 
 

AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY REPORT 
 

Authorize the Mayor to sign and execute the Amended Cooperative Agreement between 
the Wyoming Department of Transportation, City of Cody, and Park County 

for continued participation in the Urban Systems Program 
 
ACTION TO BE TAKEN  
Authorize the Mayor to sign and execute the Amended Cooperative Agreement and all associated 
documents for continued participation in the WYDOT Urban Systems Program. 
 
SUMMARY OF INFORMATION 
The City of Cody and Park County participate in the Wyoming Department of Transportation 
(WYDOT) Urban Systems Program to receive funding for the Cody Urban Area comprised primarily of 
the incorporated City limits and some unincorporated area to the east of the City.  This program 
provides Urban Systems Funding each year for use on eligible projects within the Cody Urban Area, 
and the funding is usually built-up in the City’s account for five to ten years for use on larger design 
and construction projects.  The previous version of the Cooperative Agreement between WYDOT, the 
City of Cody, and Park County was executed in January 2001, and this Amended Cooperative 
Agreement captures numerous updates and modifications required by WYDOT for continued 
participation in the Urban Systems Program. 
 
The Park County Attorney previously reviewed the Amended Cooperative Agreement, and provided 
comments to WYDOT for requested revisions.  The version of the agreement attached contains those 
revisions, and is scheduled for approval by the Park County Board of Commissioners at their meeting 
on Tuesday, April 19, 2022.  The City Attorney has also reviewed the original and revised version of 
the Agreement.  
 
This Amended Cooperative Agreement, the Cody Urban Systems and Traffic Committee, and the 
committee appointments were presented for discussion with the City Council at the Work Session 
held on March 8, 2022.      
 
FISCAL IMPACT 
Per the conditions of the Cooperative Agreement, the Cody Urban Area fund will receive $172,825.00 
of funding per year for eligible projects.  This funding is typically saved for several years to build up 
the account balance, and larger projects are generally completed every five to ten years.  The current 
Cody Urban Area fund balance is $1,735,901 and will increase in October 2022 with the additional 
funds deposited by WYDOT with their FY 2023 Budget. 
 
ATTACHMENTS 

1. Amended and Restated Cooperative Agreement among the Wyoming Department of 
Transportation, City of Cody, and Park County 

2. Cooperative Agreement for the Planning, Designation, and Maintenance of Urban 
Transportation Systems (original agreement), executed January 2001 

 

MEETING DATE: APRIL 19, 2022 

DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS - STREETS 

PREPARED BY:  PHILLIP M. BOWMAN, P.E. 
PRESENTED BY: PHILLIP M. BOWMAN, P.E. 



 
Amended and Restated Cooperative Agreement 70447 among the Wyoming Department of Transportation, 

City of Cody and Park County 
Page 1 of 11 

Agreement No. 70447 
 
 
 

AMENDED AND RESTATED COOPERATIVE AGREEMENT AMONG 
THE WYOMING DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION, 

CITY OF CODY AND PARK COUNTY 
 
 
 
1. Parties. The parties to this Amended and Restated Agreement (Agreement) are the 

Wyoming Department of Transportation (WYDOT) whose address is: 5300 Bishop 
Boulevard, Cheyenne, WY 82009-3340, the City of Cody, (City) whose address is: 1338 
Rumsey Avenue, Cody, WY  82414 and Park County (County) whose address is:  1002 
Sheridan Avenue, Cody, WY  82414. 
 

2. Purpose of Agreement. The purpose of this Agreement is to: amend and restate the 
agreement among the WYDOT, the City, and the County dated January 29, 2001 (the 
Original Agreement), in its entirety, and to set forth the terms and conditions by which 
the parties will participate in WYDOT’s Urban Systems Program in the Cody Urban 
Area, Park County, Wyoming.  
 
The Original Agreement, dated January 29, 2001, set forth the terms and conditions by 
which the parties would participate in WYDOT’s Urban Systems Program in the Cody 
Urban Area, Park County, Wyoming.  

 
3. Term of Agreement. This Agreement is effective when all parties have executed it 

(Effective Date). The term of the Agreement shall remain in full force and effect until 
terminated. This Agreement is intended to span the duration of the FAST Act (Fixing 
America’s Surface Transportation) highway legislation and any related extensions, 
continuing resolutions, or modifications to this legislation.  
 

4. Funding. 
 

A. The Surface Transportation Program Urban (STP-U) fund balance is administered 
and held in trust by WYDOT and is funded at the discretion of the Transportation 
Commission of Wyoming. WYDOT may distribute STP-U funds for preliminary 
engineering as well as construction of Urban System projects. WYDOT will 
allocate and distribute the funds to the urban areas in Wyoming that in the Urban 
Program according to the following formula:  

  
                           Corporate Boundary population_______________ 
Total corporate population of all Urban Systems areas in Wyoming 

 
The total annual allocation to the Cody Urban Systems Program under this MOU 
shall be approximately One hundred seventy-two thousand eight hundred twenty-



 
Amended and Restated Cooperative Agreement 70447 among the Wyoming Department of Transportation, 

City of Cody and Park County 
Page 2 of 11 

five dollars ($172,825.00). This amount may be adjusted at the time of the 
decennial census when population numbers become available and/or if the 
Transportation Commission adjusts the total allocation. 

 
B. WYDOT agrees to pay a maximum of ninety and forty-nine hundredths percent 

(90.49%) of the total cost of any Urban Systems projects utilizing Urban Systems 
funds. The City and/or County agree to reimburse a combined minimum of nine 
and fifty-one hundredths percent (9.51%) local match of the total cost of any 
Urban Systems projects utilizing Urban Systems funds.  The local match shall be 
paid by the appropriate local governing agency for all project activities charged to 
the Urban Systems Program, within the boundaries shown in Attachment A, 
which is attached to and incorporated into this Agreement by this reference. The 
total project reimbursement dollar amount under this Agreement by the City and 
County shall be set by individual Urban Systems project agreements. 

  
5. Responsibilities of the City and County.  The City and County shall: 

 
A. Jointly Plan and participate in WYDOT’s Urban Systems Program in accordance 

with WYDOT’s Operating Policy 2-4, as may be amended from time to time, and 
which is incorporated into this Agreement by this reference, or as directed by 
WYDOT.  
 

B. Reimburse WYDOT in accordance with Section 4, above.  
 

C. Be responsible for any costs beyond the maximum amount of funding set forth in 
Section 4, above. 
 

D. Ensure that the Special and General Provisions contained in this Agreement also 
apply to any consultants hired by the City or County under this Agreement. 

 
6. Responsibilities of WYDOT.  WYDOT shall: 

 
A. Provide planning, organization, and construction assistance for urban 

transportation system improvements intended to benefit the traveling public, to 
include increasing street and highway system traffic capacity and improving 
safety. 

 
B.  Set aside STP-U funds on an annual basis and pay for the projects funded by this 

Agreement in accordance with Section 4, above.   
 
7. Federal Special Provisions. 

 
A. Administration of Federal Funds.  The City and County agree their use of the 

funds awarded herein is subject to the Uniform Administrative Requirements of 2 
CFR Part 200, et seq.; any additional requirements set forth by the federal funding 



 
Amended and Restated Cooperative Agreement 70447 among the Wyoming Department of Transportation, 

City of Cody and Park County 
Page 3 of 11 

agency; all applicable regulations published in the Code of Federal Regulations; 
and other program guidance as provided to it by WYDOT. 

 
 B. Assumption of Risk.  The City and County shall assume the risk of any loss of 

state or federal funding, either administrative or program dollars, due to the City 
or County’s failure to comply with state or federal requirements.  WYDOT shall 
notify the City and County of any state or federal determination of 
noncompliance. 

 
C. Conflict of interest. Per 2 CFR 200.112, the City and County must disclose in 

writing any potential conflict of interest to WYDOT including financial or other 
personal interests. 

 
D. Copyright License and Patent Rights.  The City and County acknowledges that 

federal grantor, the State of Wyoming, and WYDOT reserve a royalty-free, 
nonexclusive, unlimited, and irrevocable license to reproduce, publish, or 
otherwise use, and to authorize others to use, for federal and state government 
purposes: (1) the copyright in any work developed under this Agreement; and (2) 
any rights of copyright to which the City or County purchases ownership using 
funds awarded under this Agreement.  The City and County must consult with 
WYDOT regarding any patent rights that arise from, or are purchased with, funds 
awarded under this Agreement. 

 
E. Environmental Policy Acts.  The City and County agree all activities under this 

Agreement will comply with the Clean Air Act, the Clean Water Act, the National 
Environmental Policy Act, and other related provisions of federal environmental 
protection laws, rules or regulations. 

 
F. Federal Audit Requirements. The City and County agree that if either expends 

an aggregate amount of seven hundred fifty thousand dollars ($750,000.00) or 
more in federal funds during its fiscal year, that entity must undergo and 
organization-wide financial and compliance single audit. The City and County 
agree to comply with the audit requirements of the U.S. General Accounting 
Office Government Auditing Standards and Audit Requirements of 2 CFR Part 
200, Subpart F. If findings are made which cover any part of this Agreement, the 
City and County shall provide one (1) copy of the audit report to WYDOT and 
require the release of the audit report by its auditor be held until adjusting entries 
are disclosed and made to WYDOT’s records. 

 
G. Human Trafficking.  As required by 22 U.S.C. § 7104(g) and 2 CFR Part 175, 

this Agreement may be terminated without penalty if a private entity that receives 
funds under this Agreement: 
 
(i) Engages in severe forms of trafficking in persons during the period of time 

that the award is in effect; 
 



 
Amended and Restated Cooperative Agreement 70447 among the Wyoming Department of Transportation, 

City of Cody and Park County 
Page 4 of 11 

(ii) Procures a commercial sex act during the period of time that the award is 
in effect; or 

 
(iii) Uses forced labor in the performance of the award or subawards under the 

award. 
 

H. Kickbacks.  The City and County certify and warrant that no gratuities, 
kickbacks, or contingency fees were paid in connection with this Agreement, nor 
were any fees, commissions, gifts, or other considerations made contingent upon 
the award of this Agreement.  If the City or County breach or violate this 
warranty, WYDOT may, at its discretion, terminate this Agreement without 
liability to WYDOT, or deduct from the agreed upon price or consideration, or 
otherwise recover, the full amount of any commission, percentage, brokerage, or 
contingency fee.   

 
I. Limitations on Lobbying Activities.  By signing this Agreement, the City and 

County certify and agree that, in accordance with P.L. 101-121, payments made 
from a federal grant shall not be utilized by the City or County or its 
subcontractors in connection with lobbying member(s) of Congress, or any 
federal agency in connection with the award of a federal grant, contract, 
cooperative agreement, or loan.  

 
J. Mandatory Disclosures. Per 2CFR 200.113, the City and County must disclose, 

in a timely manner, in writing to WYDOT all violations of federal criminal law 
involving fraud, bribery, or gratuity violations potentially affecting this award. 
Failure to make required disclosures can result in remedies for noncompliance 
including suspension or debarment. 
 

K. Monitoring Activities.  WYDOT shall have the right to monitor all activities 
related to this Agreement that are performed by the City and County or their 
subcontractors.  This shall include, but not be limited to, the right to make site 
inspections at any time and with reasonable notice; to bring experts and 
consultants on site to examine or evaluate completed work or work in progress; to 
examine the books, ledgers, documents, papers, and records pertinent to this 
Agreement; and to observe personnel in every phase of performance of 
Agreement related work. 

 
L. No Finder’s Fees:  No finder’s fee, employment agency fee, or other such fee 

related to the procurement of this Agreement, shall be paid by either party. 
 

M. Non-Supplanting Certification.  The City and County hereby affirm that federal 
grant funds shall be used to supplement existing funds, and shall not replace 
(supplant) funds that have been appropriated for the same purpose. The City and 
County should be able to document that any reduction in non-federal resources 
occurred for reasons other than the receipt or expected receipt of federal funds 
under this Agreement. 

 



 
Amended and Restated Cooperative Agreement 70447 among the Wyoming Department of Transportation, 

City of Cody and Park County 
Page 5 of 11 

N. Nondiscrimination.  The City and County shall comply with the Civil Rights Act 
of 1964, the Wyoming Fair Employment Practices Act (Wyo. Stat. § 27-9-105, et 
seq.), the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA), 42 U.S.C. § 12101, et seq., and 
the Age Discrimination Act of 1975 and any properly promulgated rules and 
regulations thereto and shall not discriminate against any individual on the 
grounds of age, sex, color, race, religion, national origin, or disability in 
connection with the performance under this Agreement.  

 
O. Program Income.  The City and County shall not deposit grant funds in an 

interest bearing account without prior approval of WYDOT.  Any income 
attributable to the grant funds distributed under this Agreement must be used to 
increase the scope of the program or returned to WYDOT. 

 
P. Publicity.  Any publicity given to the projects, programs, or services provided 

herein, including, but not limited to, notices, information, pamphlets, press 
releases, research, reports, signs, and similar public notices in whatever form, 
prepared by or for the City or County and related to the services and work to be 
performed under this Agreement, shall identify WYDOT and the Federal 
Highway Administration as the sponsoring agency and shall not be released 
without prior written approval of WYDOT.  

 
Q. Suspension and Debarment.  By signing this Agreement, the City and County 

certify that neither they nor their principals/agents are presently debarred, 
suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded 
from participation in this transaction or from receiving federal financial or 
nonfinancial assistance, nor are any of the participants involved in the execution 
of this Agreement suspended, debarred, or voluntarily excluded by any federal 
department or agency in accordance with Executive Order 12549 (Debarment and 
Suspension), 44 CFR  Part 17, or 2 CFR Part 180, or are on the debarred, or 
otherwise ineligible, vendors lists maintained by the federal government.  Further, 
the City and County agree to notify WYDOT by certified mail should it or any of 
their principals/agents become ineligible for payment, debarred, suspended, or 
voluntarily excluded from receiving federal funds during the term of this 
Agreement. 

 
8. State General Provisions. Pursuant to WYDOT's written notice to proceed, the City and 

County agree to undertake and prosecute the work hereunder in accordance with the 
schedule of conditions set forth herein. 

 
A. Amendments. Any changes, modifications, revisions or amendments to this 

Agreement which are mutually agreed upon by the parties to this Agreement shall 
be incorporated by written instrument, executed by all parties to this Agreement. 
 

B. Applicable Law, Rules of Construction, and Venue. The construction, 
interpretation, and enforcement of this Agreement shall be governed by the laws 
of the State of Wyoming, without regard to conflicts of law principles. The terms 
“hereof,” “hereunder,” “herein,” and words of similar import, are intended to refer 



 
Amended and Restated Cooperative Agreement 70447 among the Wyoming Department of Transportation, 

City of Cody and Park County 
Page 6 of 11 

to this Agreement as a whole and not to any particular provision or part. The 
Courts of the State of Wyoming shall have jurisdiction over this Agreement and 
the parties. The venue shall be the First Judicial District, Laramie County, 
Wyoming. 
 

C. Assignment Prohibited and Agreement Shall Not be Used as Collateral. 
Neither party shall assign or otherwise transfer any of the rights or delegate any of 
the duties set out in this Agreement without the prior written consent of the other 
party. The City and County shall not use this Agreement, or any portion thereof, 
for collateral for any financial obligation without the prior written permission of 
WYDOT. 

 
D. Auditing and Access to Records. The City and County may be subject to 

monitoring activities by WYDOT including on-site visits, review of supporting 
documents, and limited scope audits. WYDOT and its representatives shall have 
access to any books, documents, papers, electronic data, and records of the City 
and County which are pertinent to this Agreement. All records relevant to this 
Agreement are subject to audit, including the assessment of the City’s and 
County’s overall accounting and internal control system. 

 
E. Availability of Funds. Each payment obligation of WYDOT is conditioned upon 

the availability of government funds which are appropriated or allocated for the 
payment of this obligation and which may be limited for any reason including, but 
not limited to, congressional, legislative, gubernatorial, or administrative action. If 
funds are not allocated and available for the continued performance of the 
Agreement, the Agreement may be terminated by WYDOT at the end of the 
period for which the funds are available. WYDOT shall notify the City and the 
County at the earliest possible time of the services which will or may be affected 
by a shortage of funds. No penalty shall accrue to WYDOT in the event this 
provision is exercised, and WYDOT shall not be obligated or liable for any future 
payments due or for any damages as a result of termination under this section. 

 
F. Award of Related Contracts. WYDOT may undertake or award supplemental or 

successor agreements for work related to this Agreement or may award 
agreements to other contractors for work related to this Agreement. The City and 
County shall cooperate fully with other contractors and WYDOT in all such 
cases. 

 
G. Compliance with Laws. The City and County shall keep informed of and comply 

with all applicable federal, state, and local laws and regulations in the 
performance of this Agreement. 
 

H. Confidentiality of Information. Except when disclosure is required by the 
Wyoming Public Records Act or court order, all documents, data compilations, 
reports, computer programs, photographs, data, and other work provided to or 
produced by the City and/or County in the performance of this Agreement shall 



 
Amended and Restated Cooperative Agreement 70447 among the Wyoming Department of Transportation, 

City of Cody and Park County 
Page 7 of 11 

be kept confidential by the City and County unless written permission is granted 
by WYDOT for its release. If and when the City or County receive a request for 
information subject to this Agreement, the City or County shall notify WYDOT 
within ten (10) days of such request and shall not release such information to a 
third party unless directed to do so by WYDOT. 

 
I. Entirety of Agreement. The Original Agreement, consisting of three (3) pages; 

the Exhibits, consisting of the pages stamped thereon; This Agreement, consisting 
of eleven (11) pages;  and Attachment A, Cody Urban Systems Boundary Map, 
consisting of one (1) page,  represent the entire and integrated Agreement 
between the parties and supersede all prior negotiations, representations, and 
agreements, whether written or oral. In the event of a conflict or inconsistency 
between the language of this Agreement and the language of any attachment, 
exhibit, or document incorporated by reference, the language of this Agreement 
shall control. 
 

J. Ethics. The City and County shall keep informed of and comply with the 
Wyoming Ethics and Disclosure Act (W.S. § 9-13-101, et seq.), and any and all 
ethical standards governing the City and County’s profession. 

 
K. Force Majeure. No party shall be liable for failure to perform under this 

Agreement if such failure to perform arises out of causes beyond the control and 
without the fault or negligence of the nonperforming party. Such causes may 
include, but are not limited to, acts of God or the public enemy, fires, floods, 
epidemics, quarantine restrictions, freight embargoes, and unusually severe 
weather. This provision shall become effective only if the party failing to perform 
immediately notifies the other parties of the extent and nature of the problem, 
limits delay in performance to that required by the event, and takes all reasonable 
steps to minimize delays. 
 

L. Indemnification. Except as provided in Section 8(Q) below, all parties to this 
Agreement shall assume the risk of any liability arising from their own conduct. 
No party agrees to insure, defend or indemnify the other parties. 

 
M. Independent Contractor. The City and County shall function as independent 

contractors for the purposes of this Agreement and shall not be considered an 
employee of the State of Wyoming for any purpose. Consistent with the express 
terms of this Agreement, the City and County shall be free from control or 
direction over the details of the performance of services under this Agreement. 
The City and County shall assume sole responsibility for any debts or liabilities 
that may be incurred by the City and County in fulfilling the terms of this 
Agreement and shall be solely responsible for the payment of all federal, state, 
and local taxes which may accrue because of this Agreement. Nothing in this 
Agreement shall be interpreted as authorizing the City or County or their agents 
or employees to act as an agent or representative for or on behalf of the State of 
Wyoming or WYDOT, or to incur any obligation of any kind on the behalf of the 



 
Amended and Restated Cooperative Agreement 70447 among the Wyoming Department of Transportation, 

City of Cody and Park County 
Page 8 of 11 

State of Wyoming or WYDOT. The City and County agree that no health or 
hospitalization benefits, workers’ compensation, unemployment insurance, or 
similar benefits available to State of Wyoming employees will inure to the benefit 
of the City and County or the City’s and County’s agents or employees as a result 
of this Agreement. 

 
N. Insurance Requirements. The City and County are protected by the Wyoming 

Governmental Claims Act, Wyo. Stat. § 1-39-101, et seq., and certify that they 
each are members of the Wyoming Association of Risk Management (WARM) 
pool or the Local Government Liability Pool (LGLP), Wyo. Stat. § 1-42-201, et 
seq., and shall provide letters verifying their participation in the WARM or LGLP 
to WYDOT. 

 
O. Notices. All notices arising out of, or from, the provisions of this Agreement shall 

be in writing either by regular mail or delivery in person at the addresses provided 
under this Agreement. 
 

P. Ownership and Return of Documents and Information. WYDOT is the 
official custodian and owns all documents, data compilations, reports, computer 
programs, photographs, data, and other work provided to or produced by the City 
and/or County in the performance of this Agreement. Upon termination of 
services, for any reason, the City and/or County agree to return all such original 
and derivative information and documents to WYDOT in a useable format. In the 
case of electronic transmission, such transmission shall be secured. The return of 
information by any other means shall be by a parcel service that utilizes tracking 
numbers. 

 
Q. Patent or Copyright Protection, and Rights in Data. The City and County 

recognize that certain proprietary matters or techniques may be subject to patent, 
trademark, copyright, license, or other similar restrictions, and warrants that no 
work performed by the City and/or County or its Consultants shall violate any 
such restriction. The City and/or County shall defend and indemnify WYDOT for 
any infringement or alleged infringement of such patent, trademark, copyright, 
license, or other restrictions. 
 
Copyrighting or other exclusions placed on any documents or materials developed 
by a consultant, its sublets, agents or assigns under this Agreement are prohibited. 
 
Data produced, furnished, acquired, or used in meeting the terms and conditions 
of this Agreement shall be available to WYDOT and/or the federal funding 
agency with unlimited rights. Data means all recorded information, regardless of 
form, to include both technical – scientific or technical nature – and computer 
software information. It does not include information related to administration of 
the Agreement such as financial, cost or pricing, or management information. 
Unlimited rights means that the state or federal agency has the right to use, 
disclose, reproduce, and distribute the data in any manner and for any purpose, 



 
Amended and Restated Cooperative Agreement 70447 among the Wyoming Department of Transportation, 

City of Cody and Park County 
Page 9 of 11 

and to permit others to also have unlimited rights. Meanings and uses described in 
this Section 8 (P) are superseded and/or supplemented by 48 CFR 52.227-14. 

 
R. Prior Approval.  This Agreement shall not be binding upon any party, no 

services shall be performed, and the Wyoming State Auditor shall not draw 
warrants for payment, until this Agreement has been fully executed, approved as 
to form by the Office of the Attorney General, filed with and approved by A&I 
Procurement, and approved by the Governor of the State of Wyoming, or his 
designee, if required by Wyo. Stat. § 9-2-1016(b)(iv). 
 

S. Severability. Should any portion of this Agreement be judicially determined to be 
illegal or unenforceable, the remainder of the Agreement shall continue in full 
force and effect, and either party may renegotiate the terms affected by the 
severance. 
 

T. Sovereign Immunity and Limitations. Pursuant to W.S. § 1-39-104(a), the State 
of Wyoming and WYDOT expressly reserve sovereign immunity by entering into 
this Agreement and the City and the County expressly reserve governmental 
immunity. Each of them specifically retain all immunities and defenses available 
to them as sovereign or governmental entities pursuant to W.S. § 1-39-101, et 
seq., and all other applicable law. The parties acknowledge that the State of 
Wyoming has sovereign immunity and only the Wyoming Legislature has the 
power to waive sovereign immunity. Designations of venue, choice of law, 
enforcement actions, and similar provisions shall not be construed as a waiver of 
sovereign immunity. The parties agree that any ambiguity in this Agreement shall 
not be strictly construed, either against or for either party, except that any 
ambiguity as to immunity shall be construed in favor of immunity. 
 

U. Taxes. The City and County shall pay all taxes and other such amounts required 
by federal, state, and local law, including, but not limited to, federal and social 
security taxes, workers’ compensation, unemployment insurance, and sales taxes. 
 

V. Termination of Agreement. This Agreement may be terminated, without cause, 
by any party upon thirty (30) days written notice. If the City or County terminates 
this Agreement prior to project completion then the City and County will 
reimburse WYDOT for all federal-aid funds expended. This Agreement may be 
terminated by WYDOT immediately for cause if the City or County fails to 
perform in accordance with the terms of this Agreement.   

 
W. Third-Party Beneficiary Rights. The parties do not intend to create in any other 

individual or entity the status of third-party beneficiary, and this Agreement shall 
not be construed so as to create such status. The rights, duties, and obligations 
contained in this Agreement shall operate only between the parties to this 
Agreement and shall inure solely to the benefit of the parties to this Agreement. 
The provisions of this Agreement are intended only to assist the parties in 
determining and performing their obligations under this Agreement. 



 
Amended and Restated Cooperative Agreement 70447 among the Wyoming Department of Transportation, 

City of Cody and Park County 
Page 10 of 11 

 
X. Time is of the Essence. Time is of the essence in all provisions of this 

Agreement. 
 

Y. Titles Not Controlling. Titles of sections and subsections are for reference only 
and shall not be used to construe the language in this Agreement. 
 

Z. Waiver. The waiver of any breach of any term or condition in this Agreement 
shall not be deemed a waiver of any prior or subsequent breach. Failure to object 
to a breach shall not constitute a waiver. 

 
AA. Counterparts. This Agreement may be executed in counterparts. Each 

counterpart, when executed and delivered, shall be deemed an original and all 
counterparts together shall constitute one and the same Agreement. Delivery by 
the City or County of an originally signed counterpart of this Agreement by 
facsimile or PDF shall be followed up immediately by delivery of the originally 
signed counterpart to WYDOT. 

 
 

REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK 



 
Amended and Restated Cooperative Agreement 70447 among the Wyoming Department of Transportation, 

City of Cody and Park County 
Page 11 of 11 

9. Signatures. The parties to this Agreement, either personally or through their duly 
authorized representatives, have executed this Agreement on the dates set out below, and 
certify that they have read, understood, and agreed to the terms and conditions of this 
Agreement. 

 
The Effective Date of this Agreement is the date of the signature last affixed to this page. 
 

WYOMING DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
 
 
________________________________________   _______________ 
Mark Gillett, P.E., Chief Engineer      Date 
 
 
CITY OF CODY 
 
 
________________________________________   _______________ 
Matt Hall, Mayor        Date 
 
ATTESTED BY:  
 
 
________________________________________ 
Cynthia Baker, Administrative Services Officer 
 
 
PARK COUNTY 
 
 
________________________________________   _______________ 
Dossie Overfield, Chairman       Date 
 
ATTESTED BY:  
 
 
________________________________________ 
Colleen Renner, County Clerk 
 
 
ATTORNEY GENERAL’S OFFICE: APPROVAL AS TO FORM 
 
 
________________________________________   _______________ 
Alysia Goldman, Assistant Attorney General     Date 



 
Attachment A to the Amended and Restated Cooperative Agreement 70447 among the Wyoming Department of 

Transportation, City of Cody and Park County 
Page 1 of 1 

 
Urban System Boundary Map  
 

 













AGENDA ITEM NO. _______ 
City of Cody City Council    Page 1 of 3 

 
 
 
 
 

 
AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY REPORT 

The Final Plat of the Pederson Minor Subdivision 
 
 
ACTIONS TO BE TAKEN 
Approve the final plat for the Pederson Minor Subdivision, a 2-lot subdivision, subject to conditions of 
approval. 
 
SUMMARY 
Mikel and Retha Pederson have submitted the final plat 
application for their 2-lot subdivision at 225 Robert Street.  
The proposal will divide a 1.5-acre property into two lots.  
The property is located in the medium-high density residential 
(R-3) zoning district. The final plat drawing is attached. 
 
SUBDIVISION REGULATIONS 
The subdivision ordinance requirements were reviewed with 
the preliminary plat.  The final plat is attached, as well as an 
“Improvement Plan” sheet showing the improvements for the 
pathway and irrigation pipeline. 
 
Variances approved with the preliminary plat are as follows: 

1. Variance to the alley requirement. 
2. Variance to not dedicate any additional right-of-way for 

Robert Street. 
3. Variance to the streetlighting requirement. 
4. Variance to the block length requirement. 

 
Status of Preliminary Plat Conditions: 
The conditions of the preliminary plat were as follows.  The status of each condition is noted. 
 

1. The applicant shall have a minimum 8-foot-wide pathway designed and installed along the 
Robert Street frontage of the property.  The plans must be approved by Public Works and 
installation must meet City standards.  Installation must occur prior to a building permit being 
issued for Lot 16B, or any additional development of Lot 16A, whichever occurs first.  If the 
work is not done before the final plat is recorded, include a note on the final plat about the 
outstanding requirement. 
 
Status:  The pathway is shown on the attached “Improvement Plan” for the subdivision.  
Public Works indicates that they may need additional design detail, which can be addressed 

MEETING DATE:   APRIL 19, 2022 
DEPARTMENT:  COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT 
PREPARED BY:  TODD STOWELL 
CITY ADM. APPROVAL: ________ 
PRESENTED BY:  TODD STOWELL 



AGENDA ITEM NO. _______ 
City of Cody City Council    Page 2 of 3 

through the street encroachment permit application to Public Works.  A general note has been 
added to the final plat about the outstanding requirements (Note 2).  Alternatively, the 
applicant could make payment to the City for the estimated cost of the pathway and the City 
would include its construction as part of a larger project. 
 
Construction of the pathway will necessitate some grading outside of the right-of-way.  To 
accommodate the slope of the pathway shoulder, a slope easement is needed, which is 
included as a condition of approval. 
 

2. The final plat application will need to address the surface water (irrigation) rights on the 
property.  The options are either to transfer the water rights to another property in the Cody 
Canal irrigation district, or to develop a distribution plan to utilize those water rights. Contact 
Cody Canal for approval of the irrigation distribution plan, or to give their permission for the 
State Engineer’s Office to consider a transfer of the water rights. 
Status:  The water distribution plan is attached.  It has been approved by Cody Canal.   
 

3. Coordinate the piping of the irrigation ditch with the ditch company.  Complete the piping prior 
to a building permit being issued for Lot 16B, or any additional development of Lot 16A, 
whichever occurs first.  If the work is not done before the final plat is recorded, include a note 
on the final plat about the outstanding requirement. 
Status:  The piping of the irrigation ditch is shown on the attached “Improvement Plan”, and 
has been approved by Cody Canal.  A 10” PVC pipe will be used, and pump access provided 
for both lots.  Note 2 on the plat identifies that the subdivision has outstanding improvements, 
including the piping of the ditch. 
 

4. All work within the Robert Street right-of-way requires an encroachment permit from Public 
Works, prior to excavation or construction.  It is the contractor’s responsibility to obtain the 
permit. 
Status:  Noted. 

 
Other: 
The final plat includes a 25-foot-wide access and utility easement across the north side of Lot 16B, so 
that an additional lot or two can be created west of Lot 16B at some time in the future.  The label of 
the easement should also include “irrigation”. 
 
POTENTIAL MOTION: 
The Planning and Zoning Board recommends approval of the Pederson Minor Subdivision final plat, 
subject to the following conditions: 
 
1. Installation of the pathway along Robert Street must occur prior to a building permit being issued 

for Lots 16B, or any additional dwelling on Lot 16A, whichever occurs first.  Alternatively, the 
developer may make payment to the City for the estimated cost of the pathway and the City 
would include its construction as part of a larger project at the City’s convenience. 



AGENDA ITEM NO. _______ 
City of Cody City Council    Page 3 of 3 

2. Add a slope easement for the pathway shoulder by adding the following or similar language to the 
final plat, “Slope easement granted along the east side of Lots 16A and 16B as necessary to 
accommodate a 4:1 slope for the pathway shoulder.” 

3. The irrigation mainline must be installed per the approved plan prior to issuance of any building 
permits for new dwellings. 

4. Add “irrigation” to the easement along the north side of Lot 16B. 
5. The existing approach to Lot 16B is to be removed at the time Lot 16B is developed, as access for 

Lot 16B will be from the easement along its north side. 
6. All work within the Robert Street right-of-way requires an encroachment permit from Public 

Works, prior to excavation or construction.  It is the contractor’s responsibility to obtain the 
permit. 

7. Development of Lot 16B will require a new electrical service from the pole near the southeast 
corner of the lot.  Coordinate removal of the unused overhead power line and pole on the lot with 
the electric division. 
 

ATTACHMENTS:   
Final Plat 
Improvement Plan 
Water Distribution Plan 
 
 
 
 
 
H:\PLANNING DEPARTMENT\FILE REVIEWS\MAJOR-MINOR SUBDIVISION\2021\SUB2021-05 PEDERSON\STAFF REPORTS\AGENDA SUMMARY PEDERSON FINAL PLAT.DOCX 








	Council Agenda 4-19-2022
	CM 4-5-22
	vouchers
	WCTF Arts Committee Grant Application
	RESOLUTION 2022-02
	Agenda Summary for 2021 IRC Resolution 2022-03



